P#2024-12 - STEEL BEAM
GUARD RAIL & POSTS

AWARD - FEBRUARY 8§, 2024

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

(989) 773-7131

*** AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY***

JENSEN BRIDGE
& SUPPLY COMPANY

BGR 12' x 6" sec. $9.60
WOOD POSTS $85.00
STEEL POSTS $68.00
WOOD OFFSET BLOCKS 15" $18.00
SKT - END SECTIONS $3,317.18
SRT - END SECTIONS $3,315.00
BUFFERED END SECTIONS KITS $75.00
GUARD RAIL ANCHORAGE - CAB $2,800.00

ENDING KITS (37'6")

DELIVERY

4 weeks




Proposal #2024-14
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024}

***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY ***

* there are notes on each bid proposal from the bidders*

Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
Mt. Pleasant, M| 48858
(989) 773-7131

WINTER EQUIPMENT ST. REGIS HEIGHTS MACHINERY MICHIGAN CAT VALK MANUFACTURING XCAL TOOLS WEAR PARTS & EQUIP SHULTS EQUIP, LLC
SPrice ea Total $Price ca Total $Price ea Total $Price ea Total SPrice ea Total $Price ea Total SPrice ea Total $Price ea. Total
3/4"x8"x6'
Curved Single Bevel $132.89 $79,734.00 $112.80 $67,680.00 $134.10 $80,460.00 $88.31 $52,986.00 $113.89 $68,334.00 $162.00 $97,200.00 $11.17 $66,702.00
Qty. 600 (alt bid for dbl bevel)
Rockwell Hardness $139.88 $27,976.00 $132.00 $26,400.00 $134.11 $26,822.00 $139.54 $27,908.00 $127.00 $25,400.00 $162.00 $32,400.00 $139.64 $27,928.00
Qty. 200 (alt bid for
through-hardened)
3/4"x 8" x 7
Curved Single Bevel $155.02 $31,004.00 $131.60 $26,320.00 $156.30 $31,260.00 $106.02 $21,204.00 $133.00 $26,600,00 $189.00 $37,800.00 $125.98 $25,196.00
Qty. 200 (alt bid for dbl bevel)
3/4" x 8" x 6
Curved Single Bevel [ce Blades $130.18 $13,018.00 $126.90 $12,690.00 $133.29 $13,329.00 $163.33 $16,333.00 $139.00 $13,900.00 $151.00 $15,100.00 $133.96 $13,396.00
Qty. 100 (Jouble} (dbl bevel only)
3/4"x8"x 7T
Curved Single Bevel Ice Blades $151.88 $4,556.40 $148.05 $4.441.50 $156.94 $4,708.20 $163.00 $4,890.00 $176,00 $5,280.00 $169.12 $5,073.60
Qty. 30 (Jouble} (dbl bevel only)
5/8" x 8" x 11'Flat
Side Plow Blades $131.63 $6,581.50 $189.75 $9,487.50 $128.86 $6,443.00 $129.00 $6,450.00 $152.00 $760.00 $155.00 $7,750.00
Qty. 50
5/8" x 8" x 108"
Wing Blades $136.96 $6,848.00 $189.00 $9,450.00 $137.33 $6,866.50 $139.00 $6,950.00 $158.00 $7,900.00 $142.00 $7,100.00
Qty. 50
5/8" x 7/8" x 8" x 6
XTRA EDGE Blade $157.58 $7,879.00 no bid no bid $144.00 $7,200.00 $182.00 $9,100.00 $147.09 $7,354.50
Qty. 50 (alt item)
1/8"x8"x12'
Flat Side Plow Blades $178.49 $3,569.80 $207.00 $4,140.00 $174.74 $3,494.80 $176.00 $3,520.00 $206.00 $4,120.00 $165.00 $3,300.00
Qty. 20
TOTAL $181,166.70 $160,609.00 $118,431.00 $156,244.00 $216,500.00 $163,800.10
MT 10105 Carbide Tools
MT 10106 Carbide Tools
MT 10107 Carbide Tools
(delivered in lots of 260 or more) $5.70 ea. no bid no bid no bid no bid $6.68 ea. $9.45 ea. $9.90 ea.
DELIVERY 10-14 days Tools/4-6 wks ARO Blades 8-10 weeks ARO 4-5 weeks ARO 30-60 Days 30 Days ARO CpU 4- 6 weeks 3 Weeks ARO
Prices Good For 30 days
NOTES: nin order value $6,000 no chg freigh see bid tab see bid tab see bid tab see bid tab

see bid proposal




P#2024-16 - PAVEMENT MARKING
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8§, 2024

***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY***

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

(989) 773-7131

P.K. CONTRACTING

MICHIGAN
PAVEMENT MARKINGY

COLD PLASTIC MARKINGS

R/R $330.00 $400.00
STOP BARS $9.00 $8.00
R-TURN ARROW $135.00 $150.00
L-TURN ARROW $135.00 $150.00
STRIAGHT THRU /R TURN $210.00 $225.00
SCHOOL $200.00 $200.00
ONLYS $140.00 $150.00
PAVE MARKING 4" YELLOW - WATERBORNH no bid $0.0580
PAVE MARKING 4" WHITE - WATERBORNE no bid $0.0560
POLYUREA MARKINGS

R/R $385.000 $300.00
STOP BARS $150.000 $8.00
R-TURN ARROW $195.000 $100.00
L-TURN ARROW $195.000 $100.00
STRIAGHT THRU /R TURN $250.000 $175.00
SCHOOL $215.000 $175.00
ONLYS $195.000 $100.00
PAVE MARKING 4" YELLOW $1.25 no bid
PAVE MARKING 4" WHITE $1.25 no bid
RUMBLE STRIPS $8.50 $9.00
REMOVING SPECIAL MARKING $2.95 $1.50
6" CROSS WALKS $3.50 $2.50
12" CROSS WALKS $6.50 $4.00




P#2024-15 SIGN MATERIALS
& STEEL POSTS
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

PAGE 1 of 3

DORNBOS SIGN & SAFETY, INC. |

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

(989) 773-7131

Punched full length 3 Ibs/ft.- Galvanized each
10 oF
el o
12 o
13" $50.04 or $47.96 {100 posts min
14" $53.89 or $51.65 [100 posts min
16"’ $61.59 or $59.03  |100 posts min
1.12# 7ft. Galvanized Post $11.38 ea.
*posts bundles of 50

Fabricated Signs Diamond Grade *20,000 Ib. minimum for lower price
Made with 3-M Red 1172C - EC Film:
30" STOP ea.
36" STOP ea.
30" STOP AHEAD ea.
36" STOP AHEAD ea.
36" YIELD ea.
12"X6" ALL WAY ea.

Aluminum High Diamond Diamond High Diamond Diamond

Sign Intensity Grade Grade Fabr. Intensity Grade Grade Fabr.
Blanks Fabr. Signs FACES Fabr, FACES
Signs Flourescent FACES Flourescent

12"vX 6" $3.13 $4.03 $4.71 $4.71 $2.81 $3.55 $3.55
12" X 18" $4.90 $7.60 $9.62 $9.62 $3.94 $6.14 $6.14
12" ¥ 36" $9.80 $15.20 $19.24 $19.24 $5.88 $9.29 $9.29
18" X 6" $3.95 $5.30 $6.31 $6.31 $3.22 $4.32 $4.32
18" X 18" $7.35 $11.40 $14.43 $14.43 $5.16 $7.97 $7.97
24" X 9" $6.40 $9.10 $11.12 $11.12 $4.44 $6.14 $6.14
24" X 18" $9.80 $15.20 $19.24 $19.24 $6.38 $9.29 $9.29
24" X 30" $16.34 $25.33 $32.07 $32.07 $8.14 $15.48 $15.48
30" STOP $20.42 $31.66 $40.09 $40.09 $10.17 $19.35 $19.35
B O R $7.63 $11.00 $13.33 $13.53 $4.55 $7.31 $7.31
30" X 30" $20.42 $31.66 $40.09 $40.09 $10.17 $19.35 $19.35
30" X 36" $24.50 $37.99 $48.11 $48.11 $12.20 $23.22 $23.22
36" STOP $29.40 $45.59 $37.73 $57.73 $14.64 $27.86 $27.86
36" YIELD $14.70 $22.79 $28.86 $28.86 $9.32 $13.93 $13.93
36" CIRCLE $29.40 $45.59 $57.73 $57.73 $14.64 $27.86 $27.86
36" X 9" $8.85 $12.90 $15.93 $15.93 $5.16 $7.97 $7.97
36" X 36" $29.40 $45.59 $57.73 $57.73 $14.64 $27.86 $27.86
36" X 48" $39.20 $60.78 $76.97 $76.97 $19.53 $37.15 $37.15
42" X 9" $10.08 $13.30 $16.84 $16.84 $5.77 $8.13 $8.13
48" ESTOP $102.27 $131.04 $152.63 $152.63 $26.04 $48.54 $49.54
48" X 9" $11.30 $15.20 $19.24 $19.24 $6.38 $9.29 $9.29
48" X 24" $26.14 $40.52 $51.31 $51.31 $13.02 $24.77 $24.77
48" X 30" $32.67 $50.65 $64.14 $64.14 $16.27 $30.96 $30.96
54" X 9" $12.53 $17.09 $21.65 $21.65 $6.99 $10.45 $10.45
0" X 9" $13.75 $18.99 $24.05 $24.05 $7.60 $11.61 $11.61
96" X 48" $104.54 $162.09 $205.25 $205.25 $82.07 $129.07 $129.07
30" STOP AHEAD $20.42 $35.02 $46.49 $46.49 $16.83 $29.32 $29.32
36" STOP AHEAD $29.40 $50.82 $67.68 $67.68 $23.34 $41.70 $41.70
RAILROAD CROSSING
48" X 9 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
PENTAGONS
30" SCHOOL $20.42 $31.66 $40.09 $40.09
36" SCHOOL $29.40 $45.59 $57.73 $57.73
TWO COLOR RED ON YELLOW
30" X 30" $20.42 $35.02 $46.79 $46.49
36" X 36" $29.40 $50.82 $67.68 $67.68

NOTE: completed signs & sign faces have a min. qty of 6 per legend for bid price



P#2024-15 SIGN MATERIALS
& STEEL POSTS
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

PAGE 2 of 3

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

(989) 773-7131

VULCAN INC. 1
Punched full length 3 Ibs/ft.- Galvanized each
10 or 10,0001b min
11 or 10,0001b min
12 or 10,0001b min
13" $58.67 or $58.67 10,0001b min
14 $63.17 or $63.17 10.0001b min
6l $72.20 or $72.20 10,0001b min
1.12# 71t. Galvanized Post $12.89 ea
Fabricated Signs Diamond Grade
Made with 3-M Red 1172C - EC Film:
30" STOP ea.
36" STOP ea.
30" STOP AHEAD ea.
36" STOP AHEAD ea.
36" YIELD ea.
12"Xe" ALL WAY ea.
Aluminum High Diamond Diamond High Diamond Diamond
Sign Intensity Grade Grade Fabr. Intensity Grade Grade Fabr.
Blanks Fabr. Signs FACES Fabr. FACES
Signs Flourescent FACES Flourescent
L2 3% 167 $2.61 $3.98 $4.61 $4.61 $3.98 $4.61 $4.61
Jgor & 18" $5.40 $9.04 $11.10 $11.41 $9.04 $11.10 $11.10
12" X 36" $9.90 $16.38 $20.40 $20.40 $16.38 $20.40 $20.40
18" X 6" $3.66 $5.38 $6.38 $6.38 $5.38 $6.38 $6.38
18" X 18" $7.87 $13.235 $16.37 $16.37 $13.25 $16.37 $16.37
24" X 9" $5.34 $8.97 $11.04 $11.04 $8.97 $11.04 $11.04
24" X 18" $9.90 $16.38 $20.40 $20.40 $16.38 $20.40 $20.40
24" X 30" $16.50 $27.30 $34.00 $34.00 $27.30 $34.00 $34.00
30" STOP $18.51 $32.94 $41.82 $41.82 $32.94 $41.82 $41.82
30" X g" $6.17 $10.21 $12.71 $12.71 $10.21 $12.71 $12.71
30" X 30" $20.62 $34.12 $42.50 $42.50 $34.12 $42.50 $42.50
30" X 36" $24.75 $40.95 $51.00 $51.00 $40.95 $51.00 $51.00
36" STOP $26.68 $47.44 $60.22 $60.22 $47.44 $60.22 $60.22
36" YIELD $15.72 $25.49 $30.77 $30.77 $25.49 $30.77 $30.77
36" CIRCLE $26.87 $47.68 $60.56 $60.56 $47.68 $60.56 $60.56
36" X 9" $7.90 $13.33 $16.45 $16.45 $13.33 $16.45 $16.45
36" X 36" $29.70 $49.14 $61.20 $61.20 $49.14 $61.20 $61.20
36" X 48" $39.60 $65.52 $81.60 $81.60 $65.52 $81.60 $81.60
42" X 9" $9.65 $16.08 $19.69 $19.69 $16.08 $19.69 $19.69
48" STOP $47.43 $84.36 $107.09 $107.09 $84.36 $107.09 $107.09
48" X 9" $10.30 $17.48 $21.65 $21.65 $17.48 $21.65 $21.65
48" X 24" $26.40 $43.68 $54.40 $54.40 $43.68 $54.40 $54.40
48" X 30" $33.00 $54.60 $68.00 $68.00 $54.60 $68.00 $68.00
54" X 9" $11.15 $19.18 $23.92 $23.92 $19.18 $23.92 $23.92
60" X 9" $12.38 $21.28 $26.52 $26.52 $21.28 $26.52 $26.52
96" X 48" $105.60 $174.72 $217.60 $217.60 $174.72 $217.60 $217.60
30" STOP AHEAD $20.62 $36.13 $44.84 $44.84 $36.13 $44.84 $44.84
36" STOP AHEAD $229.70 $52.02 $64.53 $64.53 $52.02 $64.53 $64.53
RAILROAD CROSSING
48" X 9" $55.16 $89.30 $99.26 $99.26
PENTAGONS
30" SCHOOL $16.65 $38.16 $39.73 $39.73
36" SCHOOL $25.25 $36.36 $58.64 $58.64
TWO COLOR RED ON YELLOW
30" X 30" $20.62 $34.12 $42.50 $42.50
36" X 36" $29.70 $49.14 $61.20 $61.20




P#2024-15 SIGN MATERIALS
& STEEL POSTS
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

PAGE 3 of 3

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

(989) 773-7131

MD SOLUTIONS
Punched full length 3 Ibs/ft.- Galvanized  each
13" $45.37 or $45.37 10,0001bs
14" $48.86 or $48.86 10,0001bs
16" $55.84 or $55.84 10,0001bs
1.124 7ft. Galvanized post $10.50 cach
Fabricated Signs Diamond Grade
Made with 3-M Red 1172C - EC Film:
30" STOP ea.
36" STOP ea.
ea.
ea.
36" YIELD ea.
12"X6" ALL WAY ea.
Aluminum High Diamond Diamond
Sign Intensity Grade Grade Fabr.
Blanks Fabr. Signs
Signs Flourescent
12" X 6" no bid no bid no bid no bid
12" ¥ 18" no bid no bid no bid no bid
12" X 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid
18" X 6" no bid no bid no bid no bid
18" X 18" no bid no bid no bid no bid
24" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
24" X 18" no bid no bid no bid no bid
24" ¥ 30" no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" STOP no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" X 30" no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" X 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" STOP no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" YIELD no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" CIRCLE no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" X 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" X 48" no bid no bid no bid no bid
42" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
48" STOP no bid no bid no bid no bid
48 K 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
48" X 24" no bid no bid no bid no bid
48" X 30" no bid no bid no bid no bid
54" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
60" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
96" X 48" no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" Stop Ahead no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" Stop Ahead no bid no bid no bid no bid
RAILROAD CROSSING
48" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
PENTAGONS .080 BLANKS
30" SCHOOL no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" SCHOOL no bid no bid no bid no bid
TWO COLOR RED ON YELLOW
30" X 30" no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" X 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid




Isabelta County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd. Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

PROPOSAL #2024-17 ] [ ' B B ] L Lot
MISCELLANEOUS AGGREGATES ) **Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability** 3 Page1of3 |
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024 ; ; | !
Hubscher & Son, Inc. Fisher Transportation
MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON MATERIAL LOCATION { LOADED | CYD/TON
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 22A Deerfield $10.75 Ton Limestone Delivered to:
Loomis n/a Ton Ton
N/E quad 22A/23A $28.97 Ton
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A Deerfield $10.75 N/W quad 22A/23A $30.95 Ton
Loomis $13.25 Ton S/E quad 22A/23A $30.37 Ton
S/W quad 22A/23A $30.51

PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A

Limestone 22A-23A - Delivered to Mt. Pleasant Yard

Limestone 22A-23A - Delivered to Mt. Pleasant Yard 6-AAjdelivered $27.39 Ton
22-A/23-A $21.94 Ton
Pea Gravel 3/8" Deerfield $15.50 Ton 5-B $30.29 Ton
34CS Limestone 22A-23A - Delivered to Weidman Yard
6-AA $28.75 Ton
Tile Pebble Deerfield $26.00 Ton 22-A/23-A $23.30 Ton
5-B $31.65 Ton
Crushed 1/2 Deerfield $23.75 Ton
3/4 Deerfield $23.75 Ton Ton
Stone 6A Deerfield $18.75 Ton
Washed Fill Sand Deerfield $6.50 Ton
Fill Sand Deerfield $2.50 Ton
Loomis $3.50 Ton

Ice Sand Deerfield $7.75 Ton




PROPOSAL #2024-17

MISCELLANEOUS AGGREGATES

AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

**Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability**

_|Page2of3

Specification Sfone

Central Miéhigan Sand & Gravel

MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED CYD/TON
Limestone Delivered to:
Mt. Pleasant Yard
22A $26.25 Ton PROCESSED GRAVEL - 22A Sherman Rd $7.50 Ton
23A $25.50 Ton
6A $30.99 Ton PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A Sherman Rd $7.50 Ton
Limestone Delivered to: Pea Gravel 3/8" Sherrman Rd $10.00 Ton
Weidman Yard Tile Pebble Sherman Rd $18.00 Ton
22A $27.25 Ton
23A $26.50 Ton Stone 6A Sherman Rd $12.00 Ton
B6A $31.99 Ton
Fill Sand Sherman Rd $2.25 Ton
Ice Control Sand Sherman Rd. $4.50 Ton
Delivered to: Weidman $8.00{ Per Yard
Delivered to : Mt. Pleasant $10.00] Per Yard
Birdseye Peastone Sherman Rd. Ton
(**prices effective Aprii 1, 2024**)




2024(3)

PROPOSAL #2024-17

MISCELLANEOUS AGGREGATES

AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

**Award ﬂl Bidders Based on Price & Availability™

'Page3of3

Team Elmers

Bouchey & Sons'lnc.

MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON MATERIAL LOCATION LOADED CYD/TON

Limestone Delivered to:
Mt. Pleasant Yard
22A $26.75 Ton PROCESSED GRAVEL - 22A Kapplinger $10.25 Ton
23A $26.00 Ton
6A Ton PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A Kapplinger $10.25 Ton
Limestone Delivered to: Pea Gravel 3/8" Ton
Weidman Yard Tile Pebble Ton
22A $27.50 Ton
23A $27.00 Ton Stone 6A Ton
6A Ton

Fill Sand Kapplinger $3.00 Ton
Crushed Concrete Mt.Pleasant $33.00 Yd

Ice Control Sand

Ton

Page 1




Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd. Mt. Pleasant, M! 48858

PROPOSAL #2024-18 ) | ; , {95 TYSE
TRUCKING BY THE TON ' B B |
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024
FISHER TRANSPORTATION
MATERIAL DEERFIELD CENTRAL M! LOOMIS

RATE PER TON SAND & GRAVEL

Broomfield $2.77 $6.36 Denver $3.72
Chippewa $5.13 $7.95 Vernon $3.04
Coe $5.47 $8.49 Wise $3.04
Coldwater $5.51 $2.99

Deerfield $2.74 $5.82

Denver $5.70 $6.81

Fremont $3.61 $6.85

Gilmore $4.75 $4.72

Isabella $4.37 $5.82

Lincon $4.37 $7.83

Nottawa $3.61 $4.92

Rolland $3.80 $6.36

Sherman $4.33 $4.10

Union $3.72 $6.85

Vernon $5.70 $5.21

Wise $6.65 $6.81




Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858
(989) 773-7131

P#2024-19 TIRE SERVICE & REPAIR

AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

MEEKHOF OLSON TIRE

ATS FLEET SERVICES

Road Service; Heavy Truck & Light Vehicle

plus miles/mileage

plus mile/mileage

Regular Hours $85.00 $95.00 $1.99
After Hours $105.00 $125.00 $1.99
Sunday & Holiday $105.00 $125.00 $1.99
Tire Repair & Service
Heavy Truck (20"-24.5"

Flat Repair $28.00 $35.00

(includes mount & dismount patches, plugs & wheel changes)

New Valve Stem $6.50 $4.50

(all tires as needed

Mount State Bid Tires Each $22.50 $8.00
Balance Budd Steer each $30.00 $40.00
Light Vehicle (14.5"-17")

Flat Repair $23.00 $30.00

(includes mount & dismount patches, plugs & wheel changes)

New Tire Mount & Balance each $23.00 $20.00
Grader/Loader (25" tubeless)

Flat Repair

(includes mount & dismount plugs & patches) $80.00 $75.00

O-ring each $15.00 $20.00

(as needed)

Mount State Bid Tires Each $45.00 $50.00
Tire Disposal; Each
Light (14.5"-17") $4.00 $3.00
Heavy Truck (20"-24.5") $10.00 $10.00
Grader/Loader (25") $55.00 $50.00
Farm Tractor (28"-38") $55.00 $50.00
Recapped Tires
(To include Mount & Dismount)
Trailer Cap (similar to Bandag RTP)

Size ICRC Casing w/Vendor Casing ICRC Casing  |w/Vendor Casing|
LP22.5 $163.00 $263.00 $126.93 $§176.93
11R22.5 $169.00 $269.00 $14426 $204.26
11R24.5 $169.00 $269.00 $212.96 $282.96
315/80R22.5 $170.00 $210.00 $271.11 $351.11

Drive Cap (Bandag Gripper or ICRC accepted equivalent)

Size ICRC Casing w/Vendor Casing ICRC Casing |w/Vendor Casing|
LP22.5 $169.00 $269.00 $229.82 $299.82
11R22.5 $177.00 $277.00 $234.12 $314.12
12R22.5 $181.00 $281.00 $241.28 $311.28
11R24.5 $181.00 $281.00 $244.15 $314.15
455/55R22.5 $440.00 $565.00 $419.15 $519.15
315/80R22.5 $193.00 $233.00 $263.28 $343.28

Large Truck - New Steer Tires
(to be General MS520 or State Bid BS M850) tire make & model tire make & model

LP22.5 $359.14 BFG/RCS $355.00 FST561
11R22.5 $370.27 BFG/RCS $365.00 FSTS61
12R22.5 $435.20 BFG/ST230 $395.00 FSTS61

1LP24.5 $386.28 BFG/RCS $375.00 FSTS61
11R24.5 $548.45 BFG/CCS $496.00 FST400

315/80R22.5 $554.71 BFG/CCWB $535.00 FST818
385/65R22.5 $651.46 BFG/CCWB $660.00 FST818

Large Truck - New Drive Tires (To be FS FD 835)

State Bid 11R24.5 $418.99 $475.15

455/55r22.5 $856.08 $890.24

(any size/type not listed to be state bid)

New Grader (17.5R23) Tires

XHA $2,116.08

V-Steel $1,593.84

Sno-Plus $1,963.60

V-Steel Snow Wedge $1,834.98

Michelin XTLA $1,823.76 alt. bid see proposal




P#2024-20 - GALVANIZED CORRUGATED METAL PIPE
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

Isabella County Road Commission

***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY***

ST. REGIS JENSEN CADILLAC CULVERT
CMP BANDS CMP BANDS CMP BANDS
per foot 2' only each per foot 2" only each per foot 2" only each
12"x24' 16 gauge $8.83 $17.66 $8.73 $17.46 $8.75 $18.90
12"x30" 16 gauge $8.83 $17.66 $8.73 $17.46 $8.75 $18.90
15"x16' 16 gauge $10.86 $21.72 $10.63 $21.26 $10.90 $24.00
15"x20" 16 gauge $10.86 $21.72 $10.63 $21.26 $10.90 $24.00
15"x24' 16 gauge $10.86 $21.72 $10.63 $21.26 $10.90 $24.00
18"x20"' 16 gauge $13.20 $226.40 $12.92 $25.84 $13.20 $32.00
24"x20' 16 gauge $16.91 $33.82 $16.74 $33.48 $18.25 $42.00
30"x20' 16 gauge $21.36 $42.72 $24.06 $48.12 $23.40 $70.00
36"x20' 14 gauge $31.68 $63.36 $33.52 $67.04 $34.30 $85.00
48"x20' 12 gauge $58.50 $117.00 $58.64 $117.30 $62.90 $124.00
60"x20 8 gauge $52.25 $104.50 $136.82 $273.64 $92.45 $180.00
72"x20" 8 gauge $76.95 $153.90 $163.12 $326.24 $110.90 $220.00
see bid for gauge see bid for gauge

Delivery min. order $6,500 2-3 Weeks As Needed
Prices Good For 90 Days 60 Days 90 Days

2261 E. Remus Rd.
Mt. Pleasant, M| 48858

(989) 773-7131



P#2024-24 - SMOOTH INTERIOR PLASTIC
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858
(989) 773-7131

***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY***

ETNA SUPPLY HAVILAND DRAINAGE VANDERVELDE SALES & SERVICE, INC
S.LP. SLIP JOINT{ BANDS S.ILP SLIP JOINT| BANDS S.LP. SLIP JOINT BANDS

per foot per foot each per foot per foot each per foot per foot each
12"x24 $10.00 no bid $16.40 $5.42 $5.420 $8.06 $6.20 $6.20 $8.80
15"x20' $14.40 no bid $27.40 $7.76 $7.760 $14.16 $7.90 $7.90 $13.16
18"x20" $19.90 no bid $46.65 $11.30 $11.300 $20.17 $12.00 $12.00 $18.50
24"x20' $33.75 no bid $65.80 $17.23 $17.230 $33.41 $19.40 $19.40 $32.30
36"x20' $60.00 no bid $213.00 $33.09 $33.090 $154.20 $38.10 $38.10 no bid
48"x20' $96.30 no bid $365.00 $58.57 no bid $203.25 $64.30 no bid no bid
60"x20" $153.00 no bid $568.00 $93.15 no bid $395.58 $96.70 no bid no bid
30"x20" no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Lubricant per gallon $19.00 per gallon $29.95 per gallon $12.00 (21b tub)
Perf. Drain 4"x100' $0.850 4"x100' $0.515 4"x100' $0.725
with fabric 6"x100" $1.750 6"x100' $1.22 6"x100" $1.51
DELIVERY 7 days if in stock otherwise 30 days typically within | week




AWARED FEBRUARY 9, 2023 Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

. . oy Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
**award all bidders based on price & availability**

PROPOSAL # 20234-25 GENERAL AND CENTRAL RIETH-RILEY
SPECIFIC BITUMINOUS PAVING NEEDS | ASPHALT, INC. no recycle | CONST. CO, INC. | no recycle
NE Quadrant
Mainline $74.59 $82.08 $97.55 $107.80
Approach $167.28 $174.76 $166.70 $175.95
Subdivision's $115.16 $122.65 $130.63 $141.82
SE Quadrant
Mainline $72.13 $79.61 $97.77 $108.51
Approach $167.28 $174.76 $165.98 $176.90
Subdivision's $112.26 $119.75 $131.40 $143.18
SW Quadrant
Mainline $72.95 $80.43 $93.88 $104.97
Approach $166.74 $174.76 $160.20 $171.75
Subdivision's $111.72 $119.75 $128.36 $139.98
NW Quadrant
Mainline $72.95 $80.43 $93.98 $105.20
Approach $167.28 $174.76 $161.50 $173.00
Subdivision's $112.26 $119.75 $128.98 $140.44
General Paving Needs
Skip Patching $171.74 $238.10
4' & 5' quarter crown wedging $169.30 $298.00
hotpatch needs pick up at plant $63.50 $74.50




Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858
(989) 773-7131

PROPOSAL #2024-26 BITUMINOUS COL] ACE - SAGINAW UNIQUE
PATCH AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2024 PAVING CO. PAVING MATERIALS
CP6

UPM 7 $124.00

QPR $121.25




P#2043-30 - SEEDING & MULCHING
AWARDED - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

Isabella MURIN
Corporation COMPANY
Hydrosseding w/Hydro mulch (per acre) $7,260.00 $12,100.00

Hydroseeding w/straw

Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858
(989) 773-7131




PROPOSAL #2024-35 TREE CUTTING & STUMP GRINDI

AWARDED - FEBRUARY 8, 2024

Isabella County Road Commission

award all bidders based on price & availability

2261 E. Remus Rd.
Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858
(989) 773-7131

Always There Wonsey Tree F&K Tree Ground Up Stump Grinding
Tree Care Service Service
Tree Removal & Site Clean up Hourly Rate: $170.00 $190.00 $300.00
SG40 - $150
Stump Grinding & Clean up Hourly Rate: $180.00 $120.00 $225.00 SG75 - $200




Proposal #2024-52

Brush Spray
AWARD FEBRUARY 8, 2024

Award All Bidders Based On Price & Availabilty

LHE TRUGREEN
DALTONS, INC.
Brush spraying (based on 2 qts.
of Tordon K per 100 gallons) $1.54 $3.30

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, Ml 48858

(989) 773-7131



ISABELLA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2261 E. REMUS RD. MT. PLEASANT, MI 48858
(989) 773-7131

*Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability*

PROPOSAL #2024-65 Central Asphalt, Inc.
SHOULDER GRAVELING
NE Quadrant
Mainline $38.08
Subdivision's $55.84
SE Quadrant
Mainline $34.68
Subdivision's $48.17
SW Quadrant
Mainline $31.29
Subdivision's $44 .33
NW Quadrant
Mainline $34.68
Subdivision's $48.17




