P#2023-11 EQUIPMENT RENTAL
AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

award all bidders based on price & availability

Pat McGuirk
Excavating

w/operator & fuel

Contractors
Rental Corp

w/o opperator or fuel

min. 8 hr. price per month
CAT D-5M LPF
DOZER $150/hr $4,667-$15,283
various dozers
CAT D-6M $175/hr aavailable
see bid
LOADER
CAT 950 or 966 $3,647-$8,067
$140/hr various loaders avail
see bid
MILLING MACHINE
STABILIZER/RECLAIMER
PULVERIZER
BACKHOE Cat 416CIT JD 1018D $2,712
$125/HR JD 1018M $3,137
ROLLER smooth drum $125/hr
RUBBER TIRED Sheep foot $135/hr
SCRAPER Cat 613C 11yds
$165/hr
CRANE/EXCAVATOR Cat 325L Various Excavators
$160/hr see bid
MOTOR GRADER Galion 6WD
$160/hr

DUMP TRUCK

Tandem 10cy $125/hr
Quad 15cy $130/hr

TRACTOR LOWBOY

50 ton lowboy
$140/hr




MINI MILL

SELF PROPELLED BROOM

TRACTOR W/YORK RAKE
OR W/BROOM

$125/hr

VIBRATORY SOIL
COMPACTOR

SKID LOADER w/18" MILL

VAC TRUCK

P#2023-12 - STEEL BEAM
GUARD RAIL & POSTS

AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

*** AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY***

JENSEN BRIDGE

ACTION
TRAFFIC

RMD HOLDINGS, LTD
NATIONWIDE CONST.

& SUPPLY COMPANY | MAINTENANCE GROUP

BGR 12" x 6" sec. $8.40 $12.72 $14.50
min 500 ft

WOOD POSTS $84.00 $82.00 $100.00
min. 80 ea

STEEL POSTS $71.00 $71.40 $90.00
min 80 ea

WOOD OFFSET BLOCKS 15" $19.00 $17.00 $20.00
min 80 ea
SKT - END SECTIONS $3,700.00 $231.00 ea. $3,500.00
SRT - END SECTIONS $3,500.00 $282.00 ea. $3,000.00




BUFFERED END SECTIONS KITS $79.00 $91.00 $900.00
GUARD RAIL ANCHORAGE -
CABLE $3,200.00 $2,200.00 $3,400.00
ENDING KITS (37'6"")
DELIVERY no charge, no minimum 2-6 weeks 3 weeks
prices good for 180 days min. order $5,000
P#2023-15 SIGN MATERIALS
& STEEL POSTS
AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023
PAGE 1 of 3
DORNBOS SIGN & SAFETY,
INC.

Punched full length 3 Ibs/ft.-
Galvanized each
10" or
11" or
127 or

100 posts
13! $48.20 or $46.20 min

100 posts
14! $51.91 or $49.75 min

100 posts
16" $59.33 or $56.86 min
1.12i# 7ft. Galvanized Post $11.38

*posts bundles of 50
Fabricated Signs Diamond Grade *20,000 Ib. minimum for lower price
Made with 3-M Red 1172C - EC Film:
30™ STOP ea.
36" STOP ea.
30" STOP AHEAD ea.
36" STOP AHEAD ea.
36" YIELD ea.
12"Xe6"™ ALL WAY ea.
Aluminum High Diamond Diamond High Diamond | Diamond
Sign Intensity Grade Grade Fabr. | Intensity | Grade | Grade Fabr.
Blanks Fabr. Signs FACES Fabr. FACES
Signs Flourescent FACES | Flourescent

12" X o" $3.90 $4.15 $5.03 $5.10 $2.36 $3.33 $3.41
12" X 18" $5.08 $7.94 $10.59 $10.81 $4.09 $5.49 $5.72




12" X 36" $10.16 $15.87 $21.19 $21.62 $5.18 | $10.97 $11.45
18" X 6" $4.04 $5.47 $6.80 $6.91 $2.80 $4.24 $4.36
18" X 18" $7.62 $11.90 $15.89 $16.22 $3.89 $8.23 $8.59
24" X 9" $5.08 $7.94 $10.59 $10.81 $2.59 $5.49 $5.72
24" X 18" $10.16 $15.87 $21.19 $21.62 $5.18 | $10.97 $11.45
24" X 30" $16.94 $26.45 $35.31 $36.04 $8.64 | $18.29 $19.08
30" STOP $21.18 $33.06 $44.14 $45.05 $10.80 | $22.86 $23.85
30" X 9" $6.35 $9.92 $13.24 $13.51 $3.24 $6.86 $7.16
30" X 30" $21.18 $33.06 $44.14 $45.05 $10.80 | $22.60 $23.85
30" X 36" $25.41 $39.68 $52.97 $54.06 $12.96 | $27.43 $28.62
36" STOP $30.49 $47.61 $63.56 $64.87 $15.55 | $32.92 $34.34
36" YIELD $15.25 $23.81 $31.78 $32.43 $7.78 | $16.46 $17.17
36" CIRCLE $30.49 $47.61 $63.56 $64.87 $15.55 | $32.92 $34.34
36" X 9" $7.62 $11.90 $15.89 $16.22 $3.89 $8.23 $8.59
36" X 36" $30.49 $47.61 $63.56 $64.87 $15.55 | $32.92 $34.34
36" X 48" $40.66 $63.48 $84.75 $86.49 $20.74 | $43.89 $45.79
42" X 9" $8.89 $13.89 $18.54 $18.92 $4.54 $9.60 $10.02
48" STOP $74.21 $104.64 | $132.99 $135.32 $27.65 | $58.52 $61.06
48" X 9" $10.16 $15.87 $21.19 $21.62 $5.18 | $10.97 $11.45
48" X 24" $27.10 $42.32 $56.50 $57.66 $13.82 | $29.26 $30.53
48" X 30" $33.88 $52.90 $70.62 $72.08 $17.28 | $36.58 $38.16
54" X 9" $11.43 $17.85 $23.83 $24.33 $5.83 | $12.34 $12.88
60" X 9" $12.71 $19.84 $26.48 $27.03 $6.48 | $13.72 $14.31
96" X 48" $108.42 | $169.28 | $225.99 $230.64 $55.30 | $117.04 | $122.11
30" STOP AHEAD $21.18 $35.89 $50.12 $51.03 $13.88 | $29.37 $30.36
36" STOP AHEAD $30.49 $51.59 $71.99 $73.30 $19.89 | $42.10 $43.52
RAILROAD CROSSING

48" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid

PENTAGONS

30" SCHOOL $21.18 $33.06 $44.14 $45.05

36" SCHOOL $30.49 $47.61 $63.56 $64.87

TWO COLOR RED ON

YELLOW

30" X 30" $21.18 $35.89 $50.12 $51.03

36" X 36" $30.49 $51.59 $71.99 $73.30




P#2023-15 SIGN MATERIALS
& STEEL POSTS
AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

PAGE 2 of 3

VULCAN INC.
Punched full length 3 Ibs/ft.-
Galvanized each
10,0001b
10" or min
10,0001b
11" or min
10,0001b
12" or min
10,0001b
13! $54.21 or $50.70 min
10,0001b
14" $58.38 or $54.60 min
10,000Ib
16" $66.72 or $62.40 min
1.12# 7ft. Galvanized Post $11.80 ea
Fabricated Signs Diamond Grade
Made with 3-M Red 1172C - EC Film:
30™ STOP ea.
36" STOP ea.
30" STOP AHEAD ea.
36" STOP AHEAD ea.
36" YIELD ea.
12"X6" ALL WAY ea.
Aluminum High Diamond Diamond High Diamond Diamon
Sign Intensity Grade Grade Fabr. | Intensity Grade Grade Fal
Blanks Fabr. Signs FACES Fabr. FACES
Signs Flourescent FACES | Flouresce
2™ X o" $2.32 $4.43 $5.50 $5.50
12™ X 18" $5.62 $10.73 $13.69 $13.69
12™ X 36" $12.01 $17.04 $21.84 $21.84
18" X 6" $2.98 $6.35 $7.93 $7.93
18™ X 18" $8.42 $13.55 $17.24 $17.24
24" X 9" $5.97 $9.54 $12.10 $12.10
24" X 18" $11.26 $10.73 $13.69 $13.69
24™ X 30" $18.87 $28.40 $36.40 $36.40
30" STOP $21.70 $33.20 $43.16 $43.16
30" X 9" $7.51 $11.82 $15.00 $15.00
30" X 30" $23.59 $35.50 $45.50 $45.50




30" X 36" $28.72 $42.60 $54.60 $54.60
36" STOP $31.19 $47.05 $62.20 $62.20
36" YIELD $16.50 $26.21 $32.42 $32.42
36" CIRCLE $30.85 $46.07 $61.22 $61.22
36" X 9" $8.93 $14.17 $18.00 $18.00
36" X 36" $34.29 $51.12 $65.52 $65.52
36" X 48" $45.57 $68.16 $87.36 $87.36
42™ X 9" $11.71 $16.44 $20.89 $20.89
48" STOP $55.26 $85.10 $110.57 $110.57
48" X 9" $12.04 $18.90 $24.01 $24.01
48" X 24" $30.67 $45.44 $58.24 $58.24
48" X 30" $38.12 $56.80 $72.80 $72.80
54" X 9" $14.66 $22.50 $28.21 $28.21
60™ X 9" $16.14 $25.76 $32.13 $32.13
96" X 48" $127.29 $181.76 $232.96 $232.96
30" STOP AHEAD $23.59 $36.93 $46.90 $46.90
36" STOP AHEAD $34.29 $52.60 $66.92 $66.92
RAILROAD CROSSING

48" X 9" $60.79 $120.51 $140.85 $140.85 ‘
PENTAGONS

30" SCHOOL $22.12 $40.47 $41.96 $41.96
36" SCHOOL $30.90 $58.32 $60.45 $60.45
TWO COLOR RED ON

YELLOW

30" X 30" $23.59 $36.00 $45.93 $45.93
36" X 36" $34.29 $51.84 $66.15 $66.15
P#202-15 SIGN MATERIALS

& STEEL POSTS

AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

PAGE 2 of 3

Punched full length 3 Ibs/ft.-

Galvanized

10" or 50 min.
11" or 50 min.
12" or 50 min.
13" or 50 min.
14" or 50 min.




16’ or 50 min.
1.12# 7ft. Galvanized post
Fabricated Signs Diamond Grade
Made with 3-M Red 1172C - EC Film:
30™ STOP ea.
36" STOP ea.
ea.
ea.
36" YIELD ea.
12"X6" ALL WAY ea.
Aluminum High Diamond Diamond
Sign Intensity Grade Grade Fabr.
Blanks Fabr. Signs
Signs Flourescent
12" X o"
12™ X 18"
12™ X 36"
18" X o"
18" X 18"
24™ X 9"
24™ X 18"
24™ X 30"
30" STOP
30" X 9"
30" X 30"
30" X 36"
36" STOP
36" YIELD
36" CIRCLE
36" X 9"
36" X 36"
36" X 48"
42" X 9"
48" STOP
48" X 9"
48" X 24"
48" X 30"
54" X 9"
60™ X 9"
96" X 48"




30" Stop Ahead

36" Stop Ahead

RAILROAD CROSSING

48" X 9"

PENTAGONS .080 BLANKS

30" SCHOOL

36" SCHOOL

TWO COLOR RED ON YELLOW

30" X 30"

36" X 36"

P#2023-15 SIGN MATERIALS
& STEEL POSTS
AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

PAGE 3 of 3

MD SOLUTIONS

Punched full length 3 Ibs/ft.-

Galvanized each

13" $43.16 or $43.16 10,0001bs
14" $46.48 or $46.46 10,0001bs
16" $53.12 or $53.12 10,0001bs
1.12# 7ft. Galvanized post $10.08 each

Fabricated Signs Diamond Grade
Made with 3-M Red 1172C - EC Film:

30™ STOP ea.
36" STOP ea.
ea.
ea.
36" YIELD ea.
12"Xe6"™ ALL WAY ea.
Aluminum High Diamond Diamond
Sign Intensity Grade Grade Fabr.




Blanks Fabr. Signs
Signs Flourescent

12" X 6" no bid no bid no bid no bid
12™ X 18" no bid no bid no bid no bid
12™ X 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid
18" X 6" no bid no bid no bid no bid
18™ X 18" no bid no bid no bid no bid
24" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
24" X 18" no bid no bid no bid no bid
24" X 30" no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" STOP no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" X 30" no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" X 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" STOP no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" YIELD no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" CIRCLE no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" X 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" X 48" no bid no bid no bid no bid
42" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
48" STOP no bid no bid no bid no bid
48" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
48" X 24" no bid no bid no bid no bid
48" X 30" no bid no bid no bid no bid
54" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
60™ X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
96" X 48" no bid no bid no bid no bid
30" Stop Ahead no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" Stop Ahead no bid no bid no bid no bid
RAILROAD CROSSING
48" X 9" no bid no bid no bid no bid
PENTAGONS .080 BLANKS
30" SCHOOL no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" SCHOOL no bid no bid no bid no bid
TWO COLOR RED ON YELLOW
30" X 30" no bid no bid no bid no bid
36" X 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid




P#2023-16 - PAVEMENT MARKING
AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY***

P.K. CONTRACTING

MICHIGAN
PAVEMENT MARKINGS

COLD PLASTIC MARKINGS

R/R

STOP BARS

R-TURN ARROW

L-TURN ARROW

STRIAGHT THRU /R TURN

SCHOOL

ONLYS

PAVE MARKING 4" YELLOW -
WATERBORNE

PAVE MARKING 4" WHITE - WATERBORNE

POLYUREA MARKINGS

R/R

STOP BARS

R-TURN ARROW

L-TURN ARROW

STRIAGHT THRU /R TURN

SCHOOL

ONLYS

PAVE MARKING 4" YELLOW

PAVE MARKING 4" WHITE

RUMBLE STRIPS

REMOVING SPECIAL MARKING

6" CROSS WALKS

12" CROSS WALKS




AWARD - *** AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY***
FEBRUARY 9,
2023
* there are notes on each bid proposal from the bidders*
WINTER ST. REGIS HEIGHTS MICHIGAN CAT VALK
EQUIPMENT MACHINERY MANUFACTURIN
G
SPrice | Total SPrice | Total SPrice | Total SPrice | Total SPrice | Total
ea ea ea ea ea
3/4"x8"x6'
Curved Single $135.3 | $81,210. | $114.9 | $68,940. | $144.9 | $86,940 | $86.58 | $51,948. | $135.0 | $81,00
Bevel 5 00 0 00 0 .00 00 0 0.00
Qty. 600
Rockwell $172.9 | $34,582. | $135.3 | $27,060. | $145.0 | $29,000 | $136.8 | $27,360. | $125.0 | $25,00
Hardness 1 00 0 00 0 .00 0 00 0 0.00
Qty. 200
3/4"x8"x 7'
Curved Single $201.5 | $40,306. | $134.0 | $26,810. | $168.9 | $33,798 | $103.9 | $20,790. | $157.0 | $31,40
Bevel 3 00 5 00 9 .00 5 00 0 0.00
Qty. 200
3/4"x8" x6'
Curved Single $159.4 | $15,946. | $129.3 | $12,936. | $142.8 | $14,289 | $160.1 | $16,013. | $176.0 | S17,60
Bevel Ice Blades | 6 00 6 00 9 .00 3 00 0 0.00
Qty. 100
3/4"x8"x7'
Curved Single $186.0 | $5,581.5 | $150.9 | $4,527.6 | $168.6 | $5,058. | no bid $206.0 | $6,180.
Bevel Ice Blades | 5 0 2 0 0 00 0 00
Qty. 30
5/8" x 8" x11'
Flat
Side Plow Blades | $159.4 | $7,970.0 | $187.5 | $9,377.5 | $144.3 | $7,217. | no bid $134.0 | $6,700.
0 0 5 0 5 50 0 00
Qty. 50
5/8" x 8" x 108"
Wing Blades $154.0 | $7,700.0 | $202.5 | $10,125. | $139.5 | $6,978. | no bid $142.0 | $7,100.
0 0 0 00 6 00 0 00
Qty. 50
5/8"x7/8" x 8"
X6'
XTRA EDGE $194.8 | $9,744.5 | no bid no bid no bid $153.0 | $7,650.
Blade 9 0 0 00
Qty. 50
1/8"x8"x12'
Flat Side Plow $218.4 | $4,368.6 | $204.6 | $4,092.0 | $200.8 | $4,016. | no bid $182.0 | $3,640.
Blades 3 0 0 0 2 40 0 00




Qty. 20

TOTAL $207,40

8.60

$163,86
8.10

$116,11
1.00

$186,2
70.00

MT 10105
Carbide Tools

MT 10106
Carbide Tools

$5.28

MT 10107
Carbide Tools

(delivered in lots
of 260 or more)

DELIVERY 4-6 weeks

8 weeks ARO

30-60 DAYS

Prices Good For | 1year

30 days

NOTES: see bid tab

see bid tab see bid tab

see bid tab

see bid tab

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd. Mt. Pleasant, M| 48858
(989) 773-7131
P#2023-19 TIRE SERVICE & REPAIR MEEKHOF OLSON TIRE WONDERLAND TIRE
AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023
Road Service; Heavy Truck & Light Vehicle plus plus
miles/mileage mile/mileage
Regular Hours $75.00 $110.00
After Hours $95.00 $140.00
Sunday & Holiday $95.00 $140.00
Tire Repair & Service
Heavy Truck (20"-24.5")
Flat Repair $25.00 $77.89
(includes mount & dismount patches, plugs &
wheel changes)
New Valve Stem $5.50 $5.95
(all tires as needed
Mount State Bid Tires Each $20.00 $20.25
Balance Budd Steer each $25.00 $44.75
Light Vehicle (14.5"-17")
Flat Repair $20.00 $36.83




(includes mount & dismount patches, plugs &
wheel changes)

New Tire Mount & Balance each $20.00 $24.46
Grader/Loader (25" tubeless)
Flat Repair $70.00 $145.52
(includes mount & dismount plugs & patches)
O-ring each $15.00 $21.75
(as needed)
Mount State Bid Tires Each $45.00 $75.00
Tire Disposal; Each
Light (14.5"-17") $3.50 $4.75
Heavy Truck (20"-24.5") $9.50 $12.00
Grader/Loader (25") $45.00 $137.50
Farm Tractor (28"-38") $45.00 $137.50
Recapped Tires
(To include Mount & Dismount)
Trailer Cap (similar to Bandag RTP)
Size ICRC Casing w/Vendor ICRC w/Vendor
Casing Casing Casing
LP22.5 $148.00 $248.00 $216.68 $306.68
11R22.5 $154.00 $254.00 $216.68 $306.68
11R24.5 $154.00 $254.00 $228.68 $353.68
315/80R22.5 $155.00 $200.00 $238.68 $313.68
Drive Cap (Bandag Gripper or ICRC accepted
equivalent)
Size ICRC Casing w/Vendor ICRC w/Vendor
Casing Casing Casing
LP22.5 $154.00 $254.00 $272.86 $362.86
11R22.5 $162.00 $262.00 $272.86 $362.86
12R22.5 $166.00 $266.00 $288.86 $373.86
11R24.5 $166.00 $246.00 $252.86 | $377.86
455/55R22.5 $440.00 $565.00 $454.77 $594.77
315/80R22.5 $178.00 $218.00 $323.86 $398.86
Large Truck - New Steer Tires
(to be General MS520 or State Bid BS M850) tire make & tire make &
model model
LP22.5 $308.60 BFG/RCS $394.38 FST561
11R22.5 $237.22 BFG/RCS $404.44 FST561
12R22.5 $435.20 BFG/ST230 $445.75 FST561
LP24.5 $245.66 BFG/RCS $421.17 FST561
11R24.5 $463.80 BFG/CCS $501.90 FST400
315/80R22.5 $479.80 BFG/CCWB $520.80 FST818
385/65R22.5 $564.60 BFG/CCWB $573.30 FST818




Large Truck - New Drive Tires (To be FS FD 835)

State Bid 11R24.5 $360.60 $367.20
455/55r22.5 $747.00 $1,200.00
(any size/type not listed to be state bid)

New Grader (17.5R25) Tires

XHA $1,451.20

V-Steel $1,543.24

Sno-Plus $1,595.20

V-Steel Snow Wedge $1,834.98 $1,834.98
Michelin XTLA $1,309.60

Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd. Mt. Pleasant, M| 48858

(989) 773-7131

P#2023-19 TIRE SERVICE & REPAIR

WONDERLAND TIRE

AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023 PAGE 2
of 2

Road Service; Heavy Truck & Light Vehicle

plus mile/mileage

plus mile/mileage

Regular Hours

After Hours

Sunday & Holiday (no Sunday's)

Tire Repair & Service

Heavy Truck (20"-24.5")

Flat Repair

(includes mount & dismount patches, plugs &
wheel changes)

New Valve Stem

(all tires as needed

Mount State Bid Tires Each

Balance Budd Steer each

Light Vehicle (14.5"-17")

Flat Repair

(includes mount & dismount patches, plugs &
wheel changes)

New Tire Mount & Balance each

Grader/Loader (25" tubeless)

Flat Repair

(includes mount & dismount plugs & patches)




O-ring each

(as needed)

Mount State Bid Tires Each

Tire Disposal; Each

Light (14.5"-17")

Heavy Truck (20"-24.5")

Grader/Loader (25")

Farm Tractor (28"-38")

Recapped Tires

(To include Mount & Dismount)

Trailer Cap (similar to Bandag RTP)

Size

ICRC Casing

w/Vendor Casing

LP22.5

11R22.5

11R24.5

315/80R22.5

Drive Cap (Bandag Gripper or ICRC accepted
equivalent)

Size

ICRC Casing

w/Vendor Casing

LP22.5

11R22.5

12R22.5

LP24.5

11R24.5

455/55R22.5

Large Truck - New Steer Tires

(to be General MS520 or State Bid BS M850)

LP22.5 FS561-FST
11R22.5 FS561-FST
12R 22.5 FS561-FST
LP24.5 FS561-FST
11R24.5 FS400-FST
315/80R22.5 FS818-FST
385/65R22.5 FS818-FST

Large Truck - New Drive Tires (To be FS FD 835)

State Bid 11R24.5 FST-FD711

455/55 R22.5

BRIDGESTONE M853

(any size/type not listed to be state bid)

New Grader (17.5R25) Tires

XHA

V-Steel




Sno-Plus

V-Steel Snow Wedge

Michelin XTLA

P#2023-20 - GALVANIZED
CORRUGATED METAL PIPE

AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE &
AVAILABILITY***

ST. REGIS JENSEN CADILLAC CULVERT
CMP BANDS CMP BANDS CMP BANDS CMP BANDS
per 2' only per foot 2'only per foot 2' only per foot 2' only
foot each each each each

12"x24' 16 $8.05 | $16.10 $8.25 $16.09 $8.07 $16.00

gauge

12"x30' 16 $8.05 | $16.10 $8.25 $16.09 $8.07 $16.00

gauge

15"x16' 16 $10.0 | $20.00 $10.15 $19.29 $9.94 $19.00

gauge 0

15"x20' 16 $10.0 | $20.00 $10.15 $19.29 $9.94 $19.90

gauge 0

15"x24' 16 $10.0 | $20.00 $10.15 $19.29 $9.94 $19.90

gauge 0

18"x20' 16 $12.1 | $24.30 $12.55 $23.85 $12.29 $24.00

gauge 5

24"x20' 16 $15.5 | $31.16 $16.05 $30.50 $15.95 $31.00

gauge 8

30"x20' 16 $19.6 | $39.36 $22.85 $43.42 $22.50 $45.00

gauge 8

36"x20' 14 $29.1 | $58.32 $30.50 $57.95 $29.95 $60.00

gauge 6

48"x20'12 $55.2 | $110.50 $56.95 $108.21 $56.90 $119.00

gauge 5

60"x20 8 gauge | no bid | no bid $118.31 $26.62 $90.50 $180.00

72"x20" 8 no bid | no bid $140.90 $281.80 $108.00 $210.00

gauge

Delivery $6500 min. $300 no charge, no minimum | as needed
partial

Prices Good For | bid states 1 year 60 days 90 days




P#2023-24 - SMOOTH
INTERIOR PLASTIC

AWARD - FEBRUARY 9,

***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE &

2023 AVAILABILITY***
| | | |
FERGUSON ENTERPRISES | MICHIGAN PIPE & VANDERVELDE SALES &
LLC VALVE SERVICE, INC
DBA FERGUSON
WATERWORKS
S.I.P | SLIP BAND | S.I.P SLIP BAND | S.I.P. | SLIP BAND | S.I.P. | SLIP BAND
JOINT S JOINT | S JOINT S JOINT |S
per | per foot | each per per each per per each per per each
foot foot foot foot foot foot foot
12"x24' | $9.8 $72.8 | $7.35 $10.5 | $6.39 | $6.39 $8.80
9 6 0
15"x20"' | S14. $107. | $9.60 $15.5 | $8.57 | $8.57 $13.1
13 92 0 6
18"x20"' | S19. $190. | $13.9 $30.0 | $13.0 | $13.00 | S18.5
21 28 5 0 0 0
24"x20' | $31. $288. | $22.6 $42.0 | $20.9 | $20.90 | S$32.3
08 00 0 0 0 0
36"x20' | $54. $883. | $43.7 $136. | $40.9 | $40.96 | n/a
24 83 5 00 6
48"x20' | no no bid | $94.1 $224. | $65.5 n/a
bid 7 00 3
60"x20" | no no bid | $139. $349. | $97.8 n/a
bid 00 00 0
30"x20' | no no bid
bid
Lubrica | per | no per $18.0 per $11.25 | 2lb
nt gal. | charge gal. 0 gal. tub
Perf. 4"x1 | $0.870 4"x10 | $0.82 4"x10 | $0.80
Drain 00' 0' 0'
with 6"x1 | $1.160 6"x10 | $1.15 6"x10 | $1.57
fabric 00' 0' 0'
DELIVER | 7-14 days based on 1/2 truckload
Y manufacturer
S.I.P | SLIP BAND | CMP SLIP BAND | CMP SLIP BAND | CMP SLIP BAND
JOINT S JOINT |S JOINT S JOINT |S
per | perfoot | each
foot
12"x24'
15"x20"
18"x20'
24"x20'
36"x20"'
48"x20'

60"x20"




30"x20"'

Lubrica
nt

Perf.
Drain

with
fabric

DELIVER
Y

Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability

PROPOSAL #2023-26 BITUMINOUS COLD ACE - SAGINAW UNIQUE
PATCH AWARD - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

PAVING CO. PAVING MATERIALS

Cp6

UPM 7

$122.00

QPR

$120.50

Proposal #2022-52

Brush Spray

AWARD FEBRUARY 10, 2022

***carry over from 2022***

Award All Bidders Based On Price & Availabilty

THE
DALTONS, INC.

Brush spraying (based on 2 qts.
of Tordon K per 100 gallons)

$1.19




P#2023-30 - SEEDING & MULCHING
AWARDED - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

Isabella

Corporation

Hydrosseding w/Hydro mulch

$4,000.00

Hydroseeding w/straw

PROPOSAL #2023-32 LIQUID CALCIUM
CHLORIDE

Award All Bidders based on price & availability

AWARDED - FEBRUARY 9, 2023

MICHIGAN CHLORIDE

BAY DUST

SALES, INC.

LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE

26% Calcium Chloride

per gallon for continuous application $0.1990 no bid
26% Calcium Chloride
per gallon county pick up at your facility $0.080 no bid

5,000 gallon loads into ICRC storage

*alternate quote for 38%

per gallon

liquid calcium chloride

9,500 gallon loads into ICRC storage

delivered & applied as directed

per gallon

$.71/gal, based on 6000 gal loads

PROPOSAL #2022-64 OVERBAND
CRACKFILL NEEDS

award all bidders based on price & availability

AWARDED - FEBRUARY 10, 2022

HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE

FAHRNER ASPHALT

WOLVERINE

& CONSTRUCTION

SEALERS, LLC

SEALCOATING, LLC

Average Estimate Per Pound




PROPOSAL #2023-35 TREE

award all bidders based on price &

CUTTING & STUMP GRINDING availability
AWARDED - FEBRUARY 9, 2023
Always Wonsey Chop Tree Ground Up Asplundh
There Tree Service Stump Grinding
Tree Care Service
Tree Removal & Site Clean up $190.00 $150.00 $135.00 $245.00 $127.89
Hourly Rate:
Stump Grinding & Clean up Hourly | $150.00 $110.00 $98.00 $135.00 $119.93

Rate:




