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Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus RAd.

P#2021-12 - STEEL BEAM Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
GUARD RAIL & POSTS *** AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY *** (989) 773-7131
AWARD - FEBRUARY 11, 2020
JENSEN BRIDGE ACTION TRAFFIC RMD HOLDINGS
& SUPPLY COMPANY MAINTENANCE dba NATIONWIDE CONST
BGR 12' x 6" sec. $9.14 $6.96 $170.00
min. 40
WOOD POSTS $59.40 $45.00 $115.00
min. 40
STEEL POSTS $51.32 $39.00 $75.00
40 min.
WOOD OFFSET BLOCKS 15" $12.72 $10.00 $22.00
90 min.
SKT - END SECTIONS $2,369.23 $2,145.00 $3,500.00
SRT - END SECTIONS $2,000.00 $1,680.00 $3,500.00
BUFFERED END SECTIONS KITS $57.50 $495.00 $750.00
GUARD RAIL ANCHORAGE - CABLE $2,000.00 $1,481.00 $3,000.00
ENDING KITS (37'6")
DELIVERY 3-4 weeks ARO 1-4 weeks 4 weeks
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Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
P#2021-16 - PAVEMENT MARKING Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
AWARD - FEBRUARY 11, 2021 *#* AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY*** (989) 773-7131
M&M PAVEMENT P.K. CONTRACTING MICHIGAN
MARKING, INC. PAVEMENT MARKINGS
COLD PLASTIC MARKINGS
R/R $550.00 $300.00 $300.00
STOP BARS $110.00 $8.00 / Ift. $7.00
R-TURN ARROW $220.00 $120.00 $125.00
L-TURN ARROW $220.00 $120.00 $125.00
STRIAGHT THRU / R TURN $400.00 $190.00 $200.00
SCHOOL $320.00 $175.00 $200.00
ONLYS $275.00 $120.00 $125.00
PAVE MARKING 4" YELLOW - WATERBORNE $0.048 / Ift. $0.053 / Ift. $0.0470
PAVE MARKING 4" WHITE - WATERBORNE $0.048 / Ift. $0.044 / Ift. $0.0460
POLYUREA MARKINGS
R/R no bid $250.00 $300.00
STOP BARS no bid $8.00 / Ift. $7.00
R-TURN ARROW no bid $90.00 $100.00
L-TURN ARROW no bid $90.00 $100.00
STRIAGHT THRU /R TURN no bid $150.00 $150.00
SCHOOL no bid $150.00 $200.00
ONLYS no bid $90.00 $125.00
PAVE MARKING 4" YELLOW no bid $0.55/ 1ft. no bid
PAVE MARKING 4" WHITE no bid $0.55 / Ift. no bid
RUMBLE STRIPS no bid $7.00 / Ift. $9.00/ 1ft.
REMOVING SPECIAL MARKING no bid $1.25 $1.00
6" CROSS WALKS no bid $0.75/ 1. $1.00
12" CROSS WALKS no bid $1.50 / 1ft. $2.00




Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd. Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

PROPOSAL #2021-17 - I
MISCELLANEOUS AGGREGATES - | |**Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability** Pagelof2 |
AWARD - FEBRUARY 11, 2021
Hubscher & Son, Inc. Fisher Transportation
MATERIAL LLOCATION | LOADED [ CYD/TON MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 22A Deerfield $7.75 Ton Limestone Delivered to:
. Loomis $8.25| Ton $22.58| Ton
N/E quad 22A/23A $24.28 Ton
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A Deerfield $7.75 N/W quad 22A/23A $23.77 Ton
Loomis $8.25 Ton S/E quad 22A/23A $24.11 Ton
See Table 902-1 S/W quad 22A/23A
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A Deerfield $8.75 Ton PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A
MODIFIED Loomis $9.75 Ton
Limestone 22A-23A - Delivered to Mt. Pleasant Yard
Limestone 22A-23A - Delivered to Mt. Pleasant Yard 6-AA|delivered $23.35 Ton
22-A/23-A $19.45 Ton
Pea Gravel 3/8" Deerfield $12.75 Ton 5-B $25.30 Ton
34CS Limestone 22A-23A - Delivered to Weidman Yard
6-AA $24.35 Ton
Tile Pebble Deerfield $20.00 Ton 22-Al23-A $20.45 Ton
5-B $26.30 Ton
Crushed 1/2 Deerfield $17.50 Ton
3/4 Deerfield $17.50 Ton Ton
Ston2 6A Deerfield $15.25 Ton
Washed Fill Sand Deerfield $4.30 Ton
Fill Sand Deerfield $2.10 Ton
Loomis $2.50 Ton
Ice Sand Deerfield $4.75 Ton

(989) 773-7131



PROPOSAL #20120-17

MISCELLANEOUS AGGREGATES [ **Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability* . Page2of2
AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020 - | '
Team Elmers
MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON

Limestone Delivered to:

Mt. Pleasant Yard

22A $19.80 Ton

23A $19.15 Ton

Limestone Delivered to:

Weidman Yard

22A $21.25 Ton Ton

23A $20.60 Ton Ton
Ton
Ton
Ton
Ton

Ton
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Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
P#2021-20 - GALVANIZED CORRUGATED METAL PIPE Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
AWARD - FEBRUARY 11, 2021 ***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY*** (989) 773-7131
ST. REGIS JENSEN CADILLAC CULVERT MICHIGAN PIPE & VALVE
CMP BANDS CcMP BANDS CMP BANDS CMP BANDS
per foot 2' only each per foot 2' only each per foot 2' only each per foot 2' only each
12"x24' 16 gauge $7.80 $15.60 $8.26 $16.52 $8.05 $16.10 $8.25 $21.75
12"x30' 16 gauge $7.80 $15.60 $8.26 $16.52 $8.05 $16.10 $8.25 $21.75
15"x16' 16 gauge $9.48 $18.96 $10.28 $20.56 $10.09 $20.18 $10.12 $27.00
15"x20' 16 gauge $9.48 $18.96 $10.28 $20.56 $10.09 $20.18 $10.12 $27.00
15"x24' 16 gauge $9.48 $18.96 $10.28 $20.56 $10.09 $20.18 $10.12 $27.00
18"x20' 16 gauge $11.55 $23.10 $12.48 $24.96 $12.24 $24.48 $12.79 $34.00
24"x20' 16 gauge $15.50 $31.00 $16.18 $32.36 $16.25 $32.50 $16.70 $44.00
30"x20' 16 gauge $19.56 $39.12 $22.24 $44.48 $19.65 $39.30 $26.80 $56.00
36"x20' 14 gauge $30.60 $61.20 $32.25 $64.50 $30.65 $61.30 $33.00 $68.00
48"x20' 12 gauge $55.25 $110.50 $57.50 $115.00 $55.90 $111.80 $55.90 $115.00
60"x20 8 gauge $56.65 $113.30 $127.36 $254.72 $89.85 $179.70 $61.18 $135.00
72"x20" 8 gauge $83.43 $166.86 $151.83 $303.66 $108.90 $217.80 $113.00 $180.00
Delivery min $6000/partial load $300 no delivery charge 7-21 days yes
Prices Good For 30 days 1 year 60 days 1 year




Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
P#2021-24 - SMOOTH INTERIOR PLASTIC Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
AWARD - FEBRUARY 11, 2021 ***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY*** (989) 773-7131
VANDERVELDE SALES ADS ETNA SUPPLY CO MICHIGAN PIPE & VALVE
S.LP. SLIP JOINT BANDS S.LLP SLIP JOINT BANDS S.LP. SLIP JOINT BANDS S.L.P. SLIP JOINT BANDS
per foot per foot each per foot per foot each per foot per foot each per foot per foot each

12"x24' $4.32 $4.32 $5.63 $4.310 $4.310 $9.00 $4.31 no bid $9.00 $4.31 $4.31 $9.00
15"x20' $5.51 $5.51 $8.44 $5.490 $5.490 $16.00 $5.49 no bid $16.00 $5.49 $5.49 $16.00
18"x20' $8.36 $8.36 $11.87 $8.340 $8.340 $26.00 $8.34 no bid $26.00 $8.34 $8.34 $26.00
24"x20" $13.44 $13.44 $20.71 $14.070 $14.070 $36.00 $14.07 no bid $36.00 $14.07 $14.07 $36.00
36"x20" $27.79 $27.79 no bid $26.15 $26.150 $116.00 $26.15 no bid $116.00 $26.15 $26.15 $116.00
48"x20' $44.47 $44.47 no bid $42.98 no bid $198.00 $42.98 no bid $198.00 $42.98 no bid $198.00
60"x20" $76.00 $76.00 no bid $75.00 no bid $350.00 $76.00 no bid $308.00 $75.00 no bid $308.00
30"x20' no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $20.22 no bid $83.00
Lubricant per gal. no bid per gal. no bid per gal. $15.00 per gal. $14.00
Perf. Drain 4"x100' $0.443 per ft. 4"x100' $0.90 per ft. 4"x100' $0.90 per ft. 4"x100' $0.900 per ft
with fabric 6"x100' $1.060 per ft. 6"x100' $1.40 per ft. 6"x100' $1.40 per ft. 6"x100' $1.400 per ft
DELIVERY 3-10 days min. $3500 or drop charge stock - 14 days yes




ISABELLA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

AWARDED FEBRUARY 14, 2019

**award all bidders based on price & availability**

PROPOSAL # 2021-25 GENERAL AND CENTRAL RIETH-RILEY
SPECIFIC BITUMINOUS PAVING NEEDS | ASPHALT, INC. no recycle | CONST. CO, INC. | no recycle
NE Quadrant
Mainline $63.68 $75.79 $79.90 $85.50
Approach $110.88 $122.99 $125.00 $134.00
Subdivision's $83.55 $95.66 $100.80 $107.00
SE Quadrant
Mainline $61.67 $73.77 $80.50 $86.90
Approach $110.88 $122.99 $128.30 $135.00
Subdivision's $30.88 $92.99 $102.00 $107.50
SW Quadrant
Mainline $61.67 $74.78 $78.50 $84.90
Approach $110.88 $122.99 $124.00 $130.00
Subdivision's $80.38 $92.99 $101.00 $108.50
NW Quadrant
Mainline $61.67 $74.78 $79.50 $86.00
Approach $110.88 $122.99 $126.00 $130.00
Subdivision's $80.88 $92.99 $102.00 $109.00
General Paving Needs
Skip Patching $115.88 $142.00
4' & 5' quarter crown wedging $113.62 $155.00
hotpatch needs pick up at plant $58.75 $63.25 13A




Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availabilipp(-__ Pleasant, MI 48858

PROPOSAL #2021-26 BITUMINOUS COLD ACE - SAGINAW UNIQUE (989) 773-7131
PATCH AWARD - FEBRUARY 11, 2021 PAVING CO. PAVING MATERIALS

CP6

UPM 7 $89.00

QPR




Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

P#2021-30 - SEEDING & MULCHING Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
AWARDED - FEBRUARY 1, 2021 (989) 773-7131
Isabella
Corporation
Hydrosseding w/Hydro mulch $3,500.00
Hydroseeding w/straw




PROPOSAL #2021-32 LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE

Award All Bidders based on price & availability Mt. Pleasant, MI
. I

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

48858

AWARDED - FEBRUARY 11, 2021 (989) 773-7131
MICHIGAN CHLORIDE - BAY DUST O
SALES, INC. LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE

26% Calcium Chloride 35%
per gallon for continuous application $0.1780 $0.561
26% Calcium Chloride 35%
per gallon county pick up at your facility $0.075 $0.498




PROPOSAL #2021-35 TREE CUTTING & STUMP GRINDING

AWARDED - FEBRUARY 11, 2021

award all bidders based on price

Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.

& availabigity pleasant, MI 48858

(989) 773-7131

Asplundh Tree Expert Wonsey Tree Chop Tree Service Brad's Stump Grinding
Service
Tree Removal & Site Clean up Hourly Rate: $127.89 $150.00 $330.00
Stump Grinding & Clean up Hourly Rate: $118.93 $98.00 $180.00 $320.00




Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Proposal #2021-52 Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
Brush Spray Award Al]l Bidders Based On Price & Availabilty (989) 773-7131

AWARD FEBRUARY 11, 2021

THE
DALTONS, INC.

Brush spraying (based on 2 qts.
of Tordon K per 100 gallons) $0.92




ISABELLA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2261 E. REMUS RD. MT. PLEASANT, MI 48858
(989) 773-7131

*Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability™

PROPOSAL #2021-65 Central Asphalt, Inc.
SHOULDER GRAVELING
NE Quadrant
Mainline $32.59
Subdivision's $46.45
SE Quadrant
Mainline $29.57
Subdivision's $39.80
SW Quadrant
Mainline $26.82
Subdivision's $36.47
NW Quadrant
Mainline $29.57
Subdivision's $39.80




