P#2020-11 EQUIPMENT RENTAL
AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.
Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

(989) 773-7131
award all bidders based on price & availability

Pat McGuirk Excavating Isabella Corporation DJ McQuestion
wioperntor & fuel 8 hr min include fucl & operator wiopcralor & fuel
5 br minimum
DOZER Cat D-5M $135/hr JD 650J 6 way blade
CatD-6M $150/hr $165/hr
LOADER Cat 950 or 966
$130/hr
MILLING MACHINE
STABILIZER/RECLAIMER
PULVERIZER Wirtgen W240i $430/hr
Wirtgen W2400 $430/hr
BACKHOE Cat 416CIT JD 310 SG
$110/hr $110/hr
ROLLER Smooth Drum $120/hr
RUBBER TIRED Sheep Foot $120/hr
SCRAPER Cat 613C011 yds
$140/hr
CRANE/EXCAVATOR Cat 325L $150/hr Kmoatsu PC300LC
$175/hr
MOTOR GRADER Galion A60608140/hr Cat 140M $175/hr
DUMP TRUCK Tandem 10cy $110/hr
Quad 15cy $8125/hr
TRACTOR LOWBOY Drop Deck Lowboy 50 ton
$125/hr
MINI MILL
SELF PROPELLED BROOM
TRACTOR W/YORK RAKE
OR W/BROOM $110/hr
VIBRATORY SOIL COMPACTOR
STREET SWEEPER
VAC TRUCK




Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
P#2020-12 - STEEL BEAM Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
GUARD RAIL & POSTS **¥* AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY*** (989) 773-7131
AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020
JENSEN BRIDGE ACTION TRAFFIC
& SUPPLY COMPANY MAINTENANCE
BGR 12' x 6" sec. $5.50 $87.50
WOOD POSTS $44.00 $45.00
STEEL POSTS $39.13 $42.00
WOOD OFFSET BLOCKS 15" $10.13 $10.00
SKT - END SECTIONS $225.00 $900.00
SRT - END SECTIONS $206.25 $187.50
BUFFERED END SECTIONS KITS $85.00 $46.25
GUARD RAIL ANCHORAGE - CABLE $1,500.00 $260.00
ENDING KITS (37'6")
DELIVERY 2-4 weeks ARO




P#2020-14 GRADER BLADES

AWARD - FEBRUARY 13,2020

***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY**#

* there are notes on each bid proposal from the bidders*

WINTER EQUIP. CO.

ST. REGIS

TRUCK & TRAILER

MICHIGAN CAT

VALK MANUFACTURING

HEIGHTS MACHINERY

ROBOTIC WELDED

$Price ea

Total

SPrice ea

Total

SPrice ea

Total

3Price ea

Total

SPrice ea

Total

$Price ea

Total

3Price ea

‘Total

3/4"x8"x6'

Curved Single Bevel

Qty. 600

$112.42

$67,452.00

$90.42

$54,252.00

384.16

$50,496.00

$70.85

$42,510.00

$91.00

$54,600.00

$65.16

$38,496 00

Rockwell Hardness

Qty. 200

511242

$22,484.00

$96.00

$19,200.00

$106.80

$21,360.00

39967

$19,934.00

$96.00

$19,200.00

$78.66

$15,732.00

3/4"x8"x 7
Curved Single Bevel
Qty. 200

$131.00

$26,200 00

$105.49

§21,098.00

$117.47

$23,494.00

38505

$17,010.00

$113.00

$22,600.00

$91.77

$18,354.00

3/4"x 8" x 6
Curved Single Bevel Ice Blades
Qty. 100

$90.6]

$9,061.00

$124.08

$12,408.00

$139.86

$13,986.00

$105.46

$10,546.00

$115.00

$11,500.00

$88.74

$8,874.00

3/4"x8"x 7
Curved Single Bevel Ice Blades

Qty. 30

$105.71

$3,171.30

$144.76

$4,342 80

$167.36

$5,020.80

$121.69

$3,650.70

$134.00

$4,020.00

$103.53

$3,105.90

5/8" x 8 x 11" Flat
Side Plow Blades

Qty. 50

$103.59

$5,179.50

$123.70

$6,185.00

$75.75

$3,787.50

no bid

no bid

$94.00

$4,700.00

$92.68

$4,634.00

5/8" x 8" x 108"
Wing Blades
Qty 50

$116.01

$5,800.50

$117.00

$5,850.00

$114.33

$5,716.50

no bid

no bid

$97.00

$4,850 00

$102.72

$5,136.00

5/8"x7/8" x 8" x 6
XTRA EDGE Blade
Qty. 50

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

$119.90

$5,995.00

no bid

no bid

$101.00

$5,050.00

n/a

1/8"x8"x12'
Flat Side Plow Blades

Qty. 20

$14195

$2,839.00

$154.60

$3,092.00

$111.00

$2,220.00

no bid

no bid

$129.00

$2,580.00

$127.01

$2,540.20

TOTAL

$142,187.30

$126,427.80

$132,075.80

$93,650.70

$129,100.00

$96,872.10

MT 10105 Carbide Tools

$6.16

3 400.40

n/a

$6.60

$573

MT 10106 Carbide Tools

MT 10107 Carbide Tools

(delivered in lots of 260 or more)

DELIVERY

single 90 days double 35 day lead

6-8 weeks ARO

13 weeks ARO

based on availability

30-45 days ARO

Prices Good For

90 days

60 days

90 days

NOTES :

min order $5,500

all grader blades posted arc

double bevel

2261 E.

Mt . Pleasant,

(989)

Isabella County Road Commission

Remus Rd4.
MI 48858
773-7131



P#2020-15 SIGN MATERIALS
& STEEL POSTS
AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020

PAGE 1 of 1

ccxzwc.m.m._dzlwlmalnj :

Isabella County Road Commission

Punched full Tength 3 Ibs/ft.- Galvanized

cach

2261 E. Remus Rd.
Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
(989) 773-7131

10 $29.89 or $27.35 20,0001b min
11 $32.88 or $30.09 | 20,000Ib min
12 $35.87 or $32.81 20,000Ib min
13! $38.86 or $35.55 | 20,000ib min
14" $41.85 or $38.28 20,000Ib min
16" $47.82 or $31.66 | 20,0001b min
[TTZ# TH. Galvanized Post $9.07
*posts bundles of 50

Fabricated Signs Diamond Grade *20,000 Ib. minimum for lower price
Made with 3-M Red 1172C - EC Film:
30" STOP ea,
36" STOP ea.
30" STOP AHEAD ea.
36" STOP AHEAD ca.
36" YIELD ea
12"Xe" ALL WAY ea.

Aluminum High Diamond Diamond High Diamond Diamond

Sign Intensity Grade Grade Fabr. Intensity Grade Grade Fabr.
Blanks Fabr. Signs FACES Fabr. FACES
Signs Flourescent FACES Flourescent

12" X 6" $1.51 $2.26 $3.03 $3.09 $0.70 $1.51 $1.58
12" X 18" $4.52 $6.80 $9.08 $9.27 $2.10 $4.80 $4.74
12" X 36" $9.05 $13.59 $18.15 $18.54 $4.20 $9.06 $9.48
18" X 6" $2.27 $3.40 $4.54 $4.64 $1.05 $2.27 $2.37
18" X 18" $6.79 $10.19 $13.61 $13.91 $3.15 $6.80 §7.10
24" X 9" $4.52 $6.80 $9.08 $9.27 $2.10 $4.53 $4.74
24" X 18" $9.05 $13.59 $18.15 $18.54 $4.20 $9.06 $9.48
24" X 30" $15.08 $22.65 $30.25 $30.90 $7.00 $15.10 $15.80
30" STOP $16.68 $26.19 $35.60 N/A $8.75 $18.88 $19.75
30" X 9" $5.67 $8.52 $11.37 $11.62 $2.63 $5.68 $5.94
30" X 30" $18.85 $28.31 $37.81 $38.63 $8.75 $18.98 $19.75
30" X 36" $22.62 $33.98 $45.38 $46.35 $10.50 $22.65 $23.70
36" STOP $24.61 $38.30 $51.87 N/A $12.60 $27.18 N/A
36" YIELD $14.48 $21.33 $28.12 N/A $6.30 $13.59 N/A
36" CIRCLE $28.29 $41.98 N/A $56.74 $12.60 N/A $28.44
36" X 9" $6.79 $10.19 $13.61 $13.91 $3.15 $6.80 $7.11
36" X 36" $27.14 $40.77 $54.45 $55.62 $12.60 $27.18 $28.44
36" X 48" $36.18 $54.36 $72.60 $74.16 $16.80 $36.24 $37.92
42" X 9" $7.94 $11.91 $15.91 $16.25 $3.68 $7.94 $8.31
48" STOP $48.24 $72.48 $96.80 N/A $22.40 $48.32 N/A
48" X 9" $9.05 $13.59 $18.15 $18.54 $4.20 $9.06 $9.48
48" X 24" $24.13 $36.24 $48.40 $49 44 $11.20 $24.16 $25.38
48" X 30" $30.15 $45.30 $60.50 $61.80 $14.00 $30.20 $31.60
54" X 9" $10.20 $15.31 $20.45 $20.89 $4.73 $10.21 $10.68
60" X 9" $11.30 $16.99 $22.69 $23.18 $5.25 $11.33 $11.85
96" X 48" $96.49 $144.96 $193.60 $197.76 $93.10 $172.50 $145.58
30" STOP AHEAD $18.85 $31.06 N/A $44.23 $11.38 N/A $23.70
36" STOP AHEAD $27.14 $44.64 N/A $63.51 $16.38 N/A $34.13
RAILROAD CROSSING
48" X 9" $38.69 $53.14 $67.46 N/A
PENTAGONS
30" SCHOOL $17.60 $26.27 N/A $36.51
36" SCHOOL $25.38 $40.23 N/A $50.31
TWO COLOR RED ON YELLOW
30" X 30" $18.94 $31.20 N/A $38.61
36" X 36" $27.14 $44.91 N/A $55.58




Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
P#2020-16 - PAVEMENT MARKING Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020 *#*AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY*** (989) 773-7131
M&M PAVEMENT P.K. CONTRACTING MICHIGAN
MARKING, INC. PAVEMENT MARKINGS
COLD PLASTIC MARKINGS
R/R $490.00 $300.00 $400.00
STOP BARS $10.30 $8.00 $8.00
R-TURN ARROW $220.00 $120.00 $140.00
L-TURN ARROW $220.00 $120.00 $140.00
STRIAGHT THRU / R TURN $290.00 $190.00 $250.00
SCHOOL $240.00 $175.00 $190.00
ONLYS $190.00 $120.00 $140.00
PAVE MARKING 4" YELLOW - WATERBORNE $0.0490 $0.0500 $0.0450
PAVE MARKING 4" WHITE - WATERBORNE $0.0480 $0.0420 $0.0450
POLYUREA MARKINGS
R/R $610.000 $250.00 $700.00
STOP BARS $11.000 $8.00 $10.00
R-TURN ARROW $175.000 $90.00 $175.00
L-TURN ARROW $175.000 $90.00 $175.00
STRIAGHT THRU / R TURN $275.000 $150.00 $275.00
SCHOOL $290.000 $150.00 $175.00
ONLYS $250.000 $90.00 $175.00
PAVE MARKING 4" YELLOW no bid $0.55 no bid
PAVE MARKING 4" WHITE no bid $0.55 no bid
RUMBLE STRIPS no bid $7.00 $8.00
REMOVING SPECIAL MARKING $1.50 $1.25 $2.00
6" CROSS WALKS $3.60 $0.75 $3.00
12" CROSS WALKS $5.00 $1.50 $6.00




Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd. Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

PROPOSAL #2020-17

MISCELLANEOUS AGGREGATES

**Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability** |Pagetof2
AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020 |
Hubscher & Son, Inc. Fisher Transportation
MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 22A Loomis $7.65 Ton Limestone Delivered to:
Deerfield $6.95 Ton
N/E quad 22A/23A $21.76
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A Loomis $7.65 N/W quad 22A/23A $23.41
Deerfield $6.95 Ton S/E quad 22A/23A $22.92
See Table 902-1 SI/W quad 22A/23A $23.25
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A Loomis $8.85 Ton PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A
MODIFIED Deerfield $7.95 Ton
Limestone 22A-23A - Delivered to Mt. Pleasant Yard
Limestone 22A-23A - Delivered to Mt. Pleasant Yard 6-AA|delivered $22.85 Ton
22-A/23-A $18.85 Ton
Pea Gravel 3/8" Deerfield $11.95 Ton 5-B $24.95 Ton
34CS Deerfield Ton Limestone 22A-23A - Delivered to Weidman Yard
6-AA $23.85 Ton
Tile Pebble Deerfield $18.50 Ton 22-A/23-A $19.85 Ton
Loomis 5-B $25.95 Ton
Crushed Concrete 22A
Ton
Stone 6A Deerfield $14.25 Ton
Washed Fill Sand Deerfield $4.15 Ton
Fill Sand Deerfield $1.95 Ton
Loomis $2.30 Ton
Ice Sand Deerfield $3.10 Ton

(989) 773-7131



PROPOSAL #20120-17

MISCELLANEOUS AGGREGATES ~ **Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability™ N ~ Page2of2.
AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020
Vestaburg Sand & Gravel
MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON MATERIAL LOCATION | LOADED | CYD/TON
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 22A Warner Rd $7.00 Ton
Ton o
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A
MODIFIED Ton
See Table 902-1
PROCESSED GRAVEL - 23A Warner Rd $7.00 Ton
Fremont Rd $7.00 Ton
Vestaburg $7.00
Ton
Ton
Ton Ton
Ton
Ton
Ton Ton
Ton
Ton
Ton
Ton
Fill Sand Warner Rd $3.00 Ton
Fremont Rd Ton
Ice Sand Deerfield Ton

Page 1



PROPOSAL #2020-18

TRUCKING BY THE TON

AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020

FISHER TRANSPORTATION
MATERIAL DEERFIELD LOOMIS
RATE PER TON
Broomfield $2.22 Denver $2.98
Chippewa $4.10 Vernon $2.42
Coe $4.38 Wise $2.42
Coldwater $4.41
Deerfield $2.28
Denver $4.41
Fremont $2.89
Gilmore $3.80
Isabella $3.38
Lincon $3.32
Nottawa $2.74
Rolland $3.04
Sherman $3.44
Union $2.98
Vernon $4.56
Wise $5.23

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E Remus Rd. Mt Pleasant, M| 48858
(989) 773-7131



Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

(989) 773-7131

P#2020-19 TIRE SERVICE & REPAIR MEEKHOF OLSON TIRE WONDERLAND TIRE CO
AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020 PAGE10f1

Road Service; Heavy Truck & Light Vehicle plus miles/mileage plus mile/mileage
Regular Hours $60.00 $72.00 $0.53

After Hours $90.00 $110.00

Sunday & Holiday $90.00 $110.00

Tire Repair & Service

Heavy Truck (20"-24.5")

Flat Repair $25.00 $62.10

(includes mount & dismount patches, plugs & wheel changes)

New Valve Stem $4.50 $4.85

(ail tires as needed

Mount State Bid Tires Each $18.00 $16.50
Balance Budd Steer each $20.00 $37.00
Light Vehicle (14.5"-17"

Flat Repair $60.00 $27.15

(includes mount & dismount patches, plugs & wheel changes)

New Tire Mount & Balance each $15.00 $18.00
Grader/Loader (23" tubeless)

Flat Repair $60.00 $104.15

(includes mount & dismount plugs & patches)

O-ring each $12.00 $15.75

(as needed)

Mount State Bid Tires Each $35.00 $65.00

Tire Disposal; Each

Light (14.5"-17") $3.50 $4.00

Heavy Truck (20"-24.5") $8.50 $10.00
Grader/Loader (25") $35.00 $125.00
Farm Tractor (28"-38") $35.00 $125.00

Recapped Tires
(To include Mount & Dismount)
Trailer Cap (similar to Bandag RTP)

Size

LP22.5 $138.00 $238.00 $165.68 $210.68
11R22.5 $144.00 $244.00 $165.68 $215.68
11R24.5 $144.00 $244.00 $175.68 $235.68
315/80R22.5 $145.00 $190.00 $187.68 $262.76

Drive Cap (Bandag Gripper or ICRC accepted equivalent)

Size

LP225 $144.00 $244.00 $177.72 $237.72
11R22.5 $152.00 $252.00 $177.72 $237.72
12R22.5 $156.00 $256.00 $182.06 $267.06
11R24.5 $156.00 $236.00 $185.53 $243.53
455/55R22.5 $440.00 $565.00 $390.77 $560.77
315/80R22.5 $168.00 $208.00 $199.08 $289.08

Large Truck - New Steer Tires
(to be General MS520 or State Bid BS M850)

LP22.5 $313.60 BFG/ST230 $315.24 FST561
11R22.5 $280.00 BFG/ST230 $315.24 FST561
12R22.5 $435.20 BFG/ST230 $347.00 FSTs561
LP24.5 $356.60 BFG/ST230 $336.65 FST561
11R24.5 $468.80 BFG/ST230 $478.00 FST400
315/80R22.5 $484.80 BFG/ST230 $447.25 FST818
385/65R22.5 $562.86 BFG/ST230 $507.92 FST818

Large Truck - New Drive Tires (To be FS FD 835)
State Bid 11R24.5 $365.60 $585.60
455/55r22.5 $920.00 $948.00
(any size/type not listed to be state bid)
New Grader (17.5R25) Tires

XHA $1,104.60 N/A
V-Steel $1,553.75 $1,323.57
Sno-Plus $1,236.00 N/A
V-Steel Snow Wedge $1,400.46 $1,553.75

Michelin XTLA $1,174.20 N/A




Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd.
P#2019-20 - GALVANIZED CORRUGATED METAL PIPE Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
AWARD - FEBRUARY 14,2019 #*AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY*** (989) 773-7131
ST. REGIS JENSEN CADILLAC CULVERT
¥ gan-g wver Pr'l ces from 2019 %
CMP BANDS CMP BANDS CMP BANDS
per foot 2' only each per foot 2' only each per foot 2' only each
12"x24' 16 gauge $6.51 $14.00 $7.12 $14.24 $6.45 $13.00
12"x30' 16 gauge $6.51 $14.00 $7.12 $14.24 $6.45 $13.00
15"x16' 16 gauge $7.90 $16.50 $8.35 $16.70 $7.55 $15.00
15"x20' 16 gauge $7.90 $16.50 $8.35 $16.70 $7.55 $15.00
15"x24' 16 gauge $7.90 $16.50 $8.35 $16.70 $7.55 $15.00
18"x20' 16 gauge $9.80 $22.50 $10.00 $20.00 $9.65 $19.00
24"x20' 16 gauge $13.30 $30.15 $13.18 $26.36 $12.15 $24.00
30"x20' 16 gauge $17.00 $39.38 $17.03 $34.06 $17.50 $38.00
36"x20' 14 gauge $24.50 $59.72 $26.55 $53.10 $24.20 $48.00
48"x20' 12 gauge $43.32 $97.47 $45.24 $90.48 $44.00 $90.00
60"x20 8 gauge $112.24 $252.10 $98.52 $197.04 $74.00 $140.00
72"x20" 8 gauge $136.93 $308.09 $122.54 $245.08 $86.00 $160.00
Delivery 1- 3 weeks ARO 10 days as needed
Prices Good For 90 days 90 days 120 days




Isabella County Road Commission

2261 E. Remus Rd4d.
P#2020-24 - SMOOTH INTERIOR PLASTIC Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858
AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020 *** AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE & AVAILABILITY*** (989) 773-7131
VANDERVELDE SALES ADS ETNA SUPPLY CO CORE & MAIN
S.L.P. SLIP JOINT BANDS S.L.P SLIP JOINT BANDS S.L.P. SLIP JOINT BANDS S.I.P. SLIP JOINT BANDS
per foot per foot each per foot per foot each per foot per foot each per foot per foot each

12"x24' $4.10 $4.10 $5.63 $4.150 $4.150 $9.00 $4.15 no bid $9.00 $4.15 $9.00 $99.30
15"x20' $5.23 $5.23 $8.44 $5.510 $5.510 $16.00 $5.51 no bid $16.00 $5.51 $16.00 $110.20
18"x20 $7.94 $7.94 $11.87 $8.080 $8.080 $26.00 $8.08 no bid $26.00 $8.08 $26.00 $161.60
24"x20' $12.76 $12.76 $20.71 $13.300 $13.300 $36.00 $13.30 no bid $36.00 $13.30 $36.00 $266.00
36"x20' $25.01 $25.01 N/A $24.90 $24.900 $116.00 $24.90 no bid $116.00 $24.90 $116.00 $498.00
48"x20’ $40.02 N/A N/A $40.93 N/A $198.00 $40.93 no bid $198.00 $40.93 N/A $818.60
60"x20" $59.90 N/A N/A $66.30 N/A $308.00 $66.30 no bid $308.00 $66.30 N/A $1,326.00
72"x20' N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A no bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
Lubricant $10.00 per gallon n/c per gallon $12.00 per gallon $12.50 per gallon
Perf. Drain 4" x 100" $0.308 per ft. 4" x 100' $0.66 per ft. 4" x 100" $0.66 per ft. 4" x 100" $0.660 per ft.
with fabric 6" x 100’ $0.810 per ft. 6" x 100 $1.25 per ft. 6" x 100 $1.25 per ft. 6" x 100 $1.120 per ft.
DELIVERY 5-7 days min. $3,500.00 7-10 days 2-7 days




ISABELLA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
AWARDED FEBRUARY 14, 2019

¥ carryover prices #rom 2019 %

**award all bidders based on price & availability**

PROPOSAL # 2019-25 GENERAL AND CENTRAL RIETH-RILEY
SPECIFIC BITUMINOUS PAVING NEEDS | ASPHALT, INC. norecycle | CONST. CO, INC. | no recycle
NE Quadrant
Mainline $59.44 $65.44 $79.90 $85.20
Approach $110.11 $118.11 $123.00 $132.00
Subdivision's $82.80 $90.80 $98.40 $103.80
SE Quadrant
Mainline $57.80 $63.80 $79.30 $85.20
Approach $108.47 $116.47 $126.30 $132.00
Subdivision's $80.77 $88.77 $98.40 $103.80
SW Quadrant
Mainline $58.29 $64.29 $77.15 $83.60
Approach $108.96 $116.96 $123.00 $126.50
Subdivision's $81.41 $89.41 $98.90 $104.60
NW Quadrant
Mainline $58.29 $64.29 $76.82 $84.40
Approach $108.96 $116.96 $124.65 $129.90
Subdivision's $77.91 $85.91 $97.30 $101.75
General Paving Needs
Skip Patching $88.00 $137.78
4' & 5' quarter crown wedging $96.00 $147.92
hotpatch needs pick up at plant $58.25 13A $57.90




Isabella County Road Commisgssion
2261 E. Remus RAd.

Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availabilippt Pleasant, MI 48858
- 1

PROPOSAL #2020-26 BITUMINOUS COLD ACE - SAGINAW UNIQUE (989) 773-7131
PATCH AWARD - FEBRUARY 13, 2020 PAVING CO. PAVING MATERIALS

CPé6

UPM 7 $89.00

QPR $87.50




P#2019-30 - SEEDING & MULCHING

AWARDED - FEBRUARY 13, 2020

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

(989) 773-7131

Isabella

Corporation

Mid Michigan
Hydro Seed

Murin

Company

Hydrosseding w/Hydro mulch

$3,000 per acre

$2.30 per syd

$4,500 per acre

Hydroseeding w/straw

$3.50 per syd




Isabella County Road Commission.

2261 E. Remus RAd.
PROPOSAL #2019-32 LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE Award All Bidders based on price & availability Mt. Pleasant., MI 48858
- 1

AWARDED - FEBRUARY 14,2019 % carry over prices from 2019 % (989) 773-7131
MICHIGAN CHLORIDE BAY DUST
SALES, INC. LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE
26% Calcium Chloride alternate 35%
per gallon for continuous application $0.1670 $0.544

26% Calcium Chloride
per gallon county pick up at your facility $0.07 $0.470




PROPOSAL #2020-35 TREE CUTTING & STUMP GRINDING

AWARDED - FEBRUARY 13, 2020

award all bidders based on price

& availability

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

(989) 773-7131

Asplundh Tree Expert All American Tree Thunder Bay Tree Brad's Stump Grinding Chop Tree Service Wonsey Tree Service
Service Service
Tree Removal & Site Clean up Hourly Rate: $123.57 $185.00 $135.00 $400.00 $390.00 $150.00
Stump Grinding & Clean up Hourly Rate: $114.91 $85.00 $90.00 $300.00 $390.00 $98.00




Proposal #2019-52

Brush Spray

AWARD FEBRUARY 14, 2019

Award All Bidders Based On Price & Availabilty

* carry over Price from 2019 ¥

Isabella County Road Commission
2261 E. Remus Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

(989) 773-7131

THE BE GREEN LAWN OWEN TREE
DALTONS, INC. SERVICE CO. INC. SERVICE
Brush spraying (based on 2 qts.
of Tordon K per 100 gallons) $0.80 $0.80 late bid




ISABELLA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2261 E. REMUS RD. MT. PLEASANT, M| 48858
(989) 773-7131

*Award All Bidders Based on Price & Availability*

PROPOSAL #2020-65 Central Asphalt, Inc.
SHOULDER GRAVELING
NE Quadrant
Mainline $29.31
Subdivision's $44.15
SE Quadrant
Mainline $26.88
Subdivision's $38.78
SW Quadrant
Mainline $24.44
Subdivision's $33.40
NW Quadrant
Mainline $26.88
Subdivision's $38.78




